
2270 GI/2019 (1) 

jftLVªh laö Mhö ,yö&33004@99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99 

 
 

vlk/kj.k 
EXTRAORDINARY 

Hkkx III—[k.M 4 
PART III—Section 4 

izkf/dkj ls izdkf'kr 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

la- 137] ubZ fnYyh] c`gLifrokj] vizSy 25] 2019@oS'kk[k 5] 1941 
No.  137] NEW DELHI,  THURSDAY,  APRIL 25,  2019/VAISAKHA  5,  1941 क� �ीय हो	योपैथी प
रषद्क� �ीय हो	योपैथी प
रषद्क� �ीय हो	योपैथी प
रषद्क� �ीय हो	योपैथी प
रषद ्   अिधसूचना अिधसूचना अिधसूचना अिधसूचना     नई �द�ली, 25 अ�ैल, 2019 संसंसंसं....    7777----2/20182/20182/20182/2018----क�क�क�क� ....होहोहोहो....पपपप....————हो�योपैथी क� �ीय प�रषद ् अिधिनयम, 1973 (1973 का 59)  क& धारा 33 क&  उप-धारा (1) ख(ड (ख) से (छ), -ारा �द. शि0य1 का �योग करते 4ए, क� �ीय हो�योपैथी प�रषद,् क� �ीय सरकार क& पूवा8नुमित से क� �ीय हो�योपैथी प�रषद ् (साधारण) िविनयम, 2018 म� सशंोधन हतुे  िन<िलिखत िविनयम बनाती ह,ै अथा8त्  :—  1.  (1)         इन िविनयम1 को क� �ीय हो�योपैथी प�रषद (साधारण) संशोधन िविनयम, 2019 कहा जाएगा।            (2)  ये शासक&य राजपA म� �काशन क& तारीख से �वृ. ह1गे ।  2.  क� �ीय हो�योपैथी प�रषद ्(साधारण) िविनयम, 2018 (यहाँ इसके बाद उ0 िविनयम1 से संदEभ8त), िविनयम 4 म�, उप िविनयम (1) म�, परंतुक म�, शHद1 “पं�ह �दन” को शHद1 “कम से कम सात �दन” से �ितIथािपत �कया जायेगा । 3. उ0 िविनयम1 के िविनयम 5 के, उप िविनयम (1) म�, शHद1 “पJतालीस �दन” को शHद1 “पं�ह �दन”  से �ितIथािपत �कया जाएगा । 4. उ0 िविनयम1 के िविनयम 6 म�- (i)  उप िविनयम (2) म� शHद “पं�ह” को शHद “सात”  से �ितIथािपत �कया जाएगा । (ii) उप िविनयम (3) म� शHद “पं�ह” को शHद “सात”  से �ितIथािपत �कया जाएगा । 5. उ0 िविनयम1 के िविनयम 45 म�, (i)  उप िविनयम (2) म� शHद1 “इL&स �दन तथा बारह �दन” को शHद1 “सात �दन तथा पाँच �दन”  से �ितIथािपत �कया जाएगा । (ii) उप िविनयम (2) के परंतुक म�  शHद1 “दस �दन” को शHद1 “तीन �दन” से �ितIथािपत �कया जाएगा । डॉ. कुमार िववेकानNद, रिजIOार सह सिचव  [िवPापन-III/4/असा./21/19] 



2   THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY  [PART III—SEC. 4] नोट  :नोट  :नोट  :नोट  : मूल िविनयम1 को संQया 7-1/90-के हो प (भाग-II) �दनांक 15 नवंबर, 2018 अिधसूचना -ारा भारत के असाधारण राजपA भाग-III, ख( ड-4 म� �दनांक 16 नवंबर, 2018 को  �कािशत �कया गया था ।               
CENTRAL COUNCIL OF HOMOEOPATHY 

NOTIFICATION 

New Delhi, the 25th April, 2019 

No. 7-2/2018-CCH.—In exercise of the powers conferred by clauses (b) to (g) of sub-section (1) of 

section 33 of the Homoeopathy Central Council Act, 1973 (59 of 1973), the Central Council of Homoeopathy, 

with the previous sanction of the Central Government, hereby makes the following regulations to amend the 

Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Regulations, 2018, namely:— 

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Amendment 

Regulations, 2019. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the official Gazette. 

2.  In the Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Regulations, 2018 (hereinafter referred to as the 

said regulations), in regulation 4, in sub-regulation (1), in the proviso, for the words “fifteen days”, the words 

“minimum of seven days” shall be substituted. 

3.  In the said regulations, in regulation 5, in sub-regulation (1) for the words “forty five days”, the 

words “fifteen days” shall be substituted. 

4.  In the said regulations, in regulation 6,—  

(i) in sub-regulation (2) for the word “fifteen” the word “seven” shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-regulation (3) for the word “fifteen” the word “seven” shall be substituted. 

5.  In the said regulations, in regulation 45,— 

(i) in sub-regulation (2) for the words “twenty one days and twelve days”, the words “seven days 

and five days” shall be substituted; 

(ii)  in the proviso to sub-regulation (2) for the words “ten days” the words “three days” shall be 

substituted. 

Dr. KUMAR VIVEKANAND, Registrar-cum-Secy. 

[ADVT.-III/4/Exty./21/19] 

Note : The principal regulations were published vide notification No. . . . 7-1/90-CCH(Pt.II), dated the  

15
th

 November, 2018 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the  

16
th

 November, 2018.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064 

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. 


		2019-04-26T19:21:58+0530
	ALOK KUMAR




