T Ho o TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India

STHTEIRUT
EXTRAORDINARY
9T [II—4vs 4
PART III—Section 4

YRR & WehTioTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

| 137 72 Taoett, ggwfaar, e 25, 2019/49T4E 5, 1941
No. 137] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, APRIL 25, 2019/VAISAKHA 5, 1941

e et aftag
Ffe=aT
7% fewett, 25 &, 2019

. 7-2/2018-%.@.?.—@@&21% FAT trﬁﬁl’q: afarfaemw, 1973 (1973 &1 59) &t & 33 ¥
ST-GTT (1) @ () | (F), FRT T&T ARRAT FT TIWT Fd g0, Haid greard=fi THug, Hsid I @l
qaEtAtT & FE greardt aivag ("remeon) fEfeam, 2018 # "o gq  Mefafew fafeaw aardt g,
AT —

1. (1) == et 1 e grearey afvos (Freameen) geee =R, 2019 Fgr S
(2) F TR TSI § YA T AT F TG g |

2. FET ZrEATTAT awg (ATemeer) fAfEE, 2018 (TRl THF 918 I fafgAt 7 §ardq), @Ffaaw 4 4,
37 =W (1) #, Qs °, 9531 “dag G F 9Eal “wH § R 919 a9 & Taeied BT S |

3. 3<% faf=awt & fofaaw 5 %, sv AR (1) 7, a=ai “darete f&a & osal “dag o & gfaeerfg
ERisIu
4, 3 A=t & fafaaw 6 -
(i) v fff=w (2) 7 erex “dug” T orex ‘AT’ & wiaeTioa BT ST |
(i) svfF=w (3) 7 erex “vgg” T orex ‘AT’ & wiawTiua T ST
5. =< At & At 45 4,

(i) 37 ARy (2) # asai ‘g o qur ang A w7 assi A fod qur aw T o#@
giaeerioa fBFar s |

(i)  STEFTE (2) F s d a=al ‘T9 &R &7 oe’i ‘A & & Tiaeriaa B s |
=f. FAT s, TR 9 a=a
[FErsTTa-111/4/39T./21/19]

2270 GI/2019 (€)]



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

A : gor Tt v "= 7-1/90-% g1 7 (WW-11) f3ATH 15 7997, 2018 ATIT=AT FRT AT F THTETIT
TSI AT-111, TUe-4 # fadis 16 Faa¥, 2018 T THTiArd f3ham am o7 |

CENTRAL COUNCIL OF HOMOEOPATHY
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 25th April, 2019

No. 7-2/2018-CCH.—In exercise of the powers conferred by clauses (b) to (g) of sub-section (1) of
section 33 of the Homoeopathy Central Council Act, 1973 (59 of 1973), the Central Council of Homoeopathy,
with the previous sanction of the Central Government, hereby makes the following regulations to amend the
Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Regulations, 2018, namely:—

1. (1) These regulations may be called the Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Amendment
Regulations, 2019.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the official Gazette.

2. In the Central Council of Homoeopathy (General) Regulations, 2018 (hereinafter referred to as the
said regulations), in regulation 4, in sub-regulation (1), in the proviso, for the words “fifteen days”, the words
“minimum of seven days” shall be substituted.

3. In the said regulations, in regulation 5, in sub-regulation (1) for the words “forty five days”, the
words “fifteen days” shall be substituted.

4. In the said regulations, in regulation 6,—
@) in sub-regulation (2) for the word “fifteen” the word “seven” shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-regulation (3) for the word “fifteen” the word “seven” shall be substituted.
5. In the said regulations, in regulation 45,—
(1) in sub-regulation (2) for the words “twenty one days and twelve days”, the words “seven days
and five days” shall be substituted;
(i1) in the proviso to sub-regulation (2) for the words “ten days” the words “three days” shall be
substituted.

Dr. KUMAR VIVEKANAND, Registrar-cum-Secy.
[ADVT.-111/4/Exty./21/19]

Note : The principal regulations were published vide notification No. 7-1/90-CCH(Pt.II), dated the

151 November, 2018 in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part III, Section 4, dated the
16™ November, 2018.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064

and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. A L O K Digi ;
gitally signed

by ALOK KUMAR

Date: 2019.04.26
KU MA R 19a:2e1 :58 +05'30'



		2019-04-26T19:21:58+0530
	ALOK KUMAR




